
How does the scheduling system
work for the 30-minute lessons?
Our scheduling system is designed
to be flexible and convenient.
Employees can book their preferred
time slot via our booking link up to
24 hours in advance, ensuring that
the lessons fit seamlessly into their
busy schedules. 

Can employees choose their
preferred teacher for each class?
No, one of the unique aspects of our
program is that you get a new
teacher for each class. This allows
learners to experience different
teaching styles and approaches,
enhancing their overall learning
experience.



Is the program available only in-
person or virtually? 
Our program is exclusively virtual,
utilizing Microsoft Teams for
seamless communication and
interaction between teachers and
students.

How do I purchase classes for this
program?
Purchasing classes is simple. You
get a package of 10, 30-minute
classes directly through our
platform.



 What if I need to cancel or
reschedule a class?
Our program is exclusively virtual,
utilizing Microsoft Teams for
seamless communication and
interaction between teachers and
students.

How do I purchase classes for this
program?
Purchasing classes is simple. You
can buy a package of 10, 
30-minute classes directly through
our platform.



Can multiple employees from the
same company enroll in the
program together? 
No, we only offer private classes for
this program. Each employee
receives personalized attention
and instruction during their private
lessons.

Are there any additional materials
or resources provided along with
the lessons?  
Yes, we provide supplementary
materials and resources to support
the lessons and reinforce learning
outside of the classroom
environment.



How do I know if this program is
the right fit for my employees? 
Our program is ideal for employees
with ultra busy schedules, making it
challenging to plan classes weeks in
advance. We offer a trial session for
interested companies to experience
our program firsthand and determine
if it aligns with their language
learning objectives and the flexibility
needed for their schedules. 

Which languages are offered via
Linga30 program? 
At the moment, we offer French and
English language training using our
Learner Profiles. 


